
DECLARATION OF COVENANTS, CONDITIONS, RESTRICTIONS AND EASEMENTS 
FOR LEGACY SHORES SUBDIVISION 

 
This Declaration of Covenants, Conditions, Restrictions and Easements for Legacy Shores 
Subdivision is made this day of November 20, 2007, by RIVER BEND LANDING, LLC, a 
Delaware limited liability company (hereinafter referred to as the "Declarant"). 
 
WITNESSETH: 
 
WHEREAS, the Declarant owns certain real property located in the County of Wilcox, State of 
Alabama, being delineated as Legacy Shores Subdivision (hereinafter referred to as the 
"Property"), which is more fully described as follows: 
 
Legacy Shores Subdivision, as recorded in: 
 
MAP BOOK #8, PAGE(S) 24 – 26 in the Office of the Judge of Probate, Wilcox County, 
Alabama. 
 
and Declarant intends to develop said property as a residential and recreational community; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Declarant intends by this Declaration to impose upon the Property mutually 
beneficial restrictions under a general plan of improvement for the benefit of all Owners of the 
Property and to provide flexible and reasonable procedures for the development and use of the 
Property. 
 
NOW THEREFORE, the Declarant hereby declares that the Property and any property hereafter 
made subject hereto as hereinafter provided shall be held, transferred, sold, conveyed, leased, 
occupied and used subject to the following easements, restrictions, covenants, charges, liens and 
conditions which are for the purpose of protecting the value and desirability of the Property, and 
which shall touch and concern and run with title to the Property. The covenants and all 
provisions hereof shall be binding on all parties having any right, title or interest in the Property 
or any portion thereof, and their respective heirs, successors, successors in title, and assigns, and 
all others claiming an interest therein or a right thereto and shall inure to the benefit of each 
Owner thereof. 
 

ARTICLE I 
IMPOSITION OF COVENANTS AND 

STATEMENT OF PURPOSE 
 
Section 1.01 Imposition of Covenants. Declarant hereby makes, declares and establishes the 
following covenants, conditions, restrictions and easements (collectively referred to as the 
"Covenants"), which shall affect all of the Property. From this day forward, the Property shall be 
held, sold and conveyed subject to the Covenants. The Covenants shall run with the land and 
shall be binding upon all persons or entities having any right, title or interest in all or any part of 
the Property, and the Covenants shall inure to the benefit of each Owner of the Property. 



Section 1.02 Statement of Purpose. These Covenants are imposed for the benefit of all Owners of 
the parcels of land located within the Property. These Covenants create specific rights and 
privileges, which may be shared and enjoyed by all Owners and occupants of any part of the 
Property. 
 
Section 1.03 Declarant' s Intent. The provisions of these Covenants, as amended from time to 
time, are intended to act as the land use controls applicable to the Property, and in the event of a 
conflict or difference between the provisions hereof and of the Wilcox County Zoning 
Ordinance, if any, the terms of this Declaration shall control and supersede such Zoning 
Ordinance. Each Owner, automatically upon the purchase of any portion of the Property, is 
deemed to waive all protections afforded to him, now or in the future, under the Wilcox County 
Zoning Ordinance to the extent such Zoning Ordinance is at variance with the provisions of this 
Declaration, as it may be amended from time to time, or with the provisions of any of the other 
documents of Legacy Shores (hereinafter referred to as "Legacy Shores Documents"), including 
but not limited to the Architectural Guidelines established by the Architectural Review 
Committee. 
 

ARTICLE II 
DEFINITIONS 

 
The following terms as used in these Covenants, are defined as follows: 
 
Section 2.01 "Absentee Ballot" shall mean and refer to the form approved by the Board and 
presented to every Member as set forth in accordance with these Covenants. An Absentee Ballot 
shall be the only form of proxy. Absentee Ballots shall only be accepted by the Secretary of the 
Association from the Member submitting the ballot. At no time may an Absentee Ballot give to 
one Member the right to vote for any other Member. 
 
Section 2.02 "Architectural Guidelines" shall mean and refer to the guidelines and rules 
established and supplemented from time to time by the Architectural Review Committee and 
approved by the Board. 
 
Section 2.03 "Architectural Review Committee" or "ARC" shall mean and refer to the committee 
formed pursuant to Article VI below to maintain the quality and architectural harmony of 
improvements in Legacy Shores. 
 
Section 2.04 "Architectural Review Committee Liaison" or "ARC Liaison" shall mean an elected 
Officer of the Association as provided in subsection (d) of Section 3.02, who is also a member of 
the ARC and communicates pertinent information between the Officers and the ARC to facilitate 
policy or actions. 
 
Section 2.05 "Approved Builders" shall mean and refer to a licensed general contractor in the 
State of Alabama holding adequate Workman's Compensation and Liability Insurance as 
required by ARC. Furthermore, they shall not have been removed from Legacy Shores Approved 
Builders list for ARC infractions. In no case, does Declarant, Legacy Shores Homeowners 
Association, or their agents accept any liability for the workmanship of these builders. 



Section 2.06 "Articles" shall mean and refer to the Articles of Incorporation of the Association, 
which have been filed with the Judge of Probate of Wilcox County, Alabama to create the 
Association. 
 
Section 2.07 "Assessments" shall mean and refer to annual, special, and Default Assessments 
levied pursuant to Article IV below to meet the estimated cash requirements of the Association. 
 
Section 2.08 "Association" shall mean and refer to Legacy Shores Homeowners Association, 
Inc., a nonprofit corporation, or any successor of the Association by whatever name, charged 
with the duties and obligations set forth in these Covenants. 
 
Section 2.09 "Building" shall mean and refer to any one or more structures constructed on a Lot 
or Tract. 
 
Section 2.10 "Board" shall mean the Board of Directors of the Association. 
 
Section 2.11 "Building site" shall mean and refer to the area within a Lot where a Building or 
other improvements shall be located, always subject to the prior written approval of the ARC. 
 
Section 2.12 "By-Laws" shall mean and refer to the By-Laws of the Association which establish 
the methods and procedures of its operation. 
 
Section 2.13 "Covenants" shall mean and refer to this Declaration of Covenants, Conditions, 
Restrictions, and Easements for Legacy Shores, as and if amended. 
 
Section 2.14 "Declarant" shall mean and refer to River Bend Landing, LLC, a Delaware Limited 
Liability Company, and its successors and assigns. 
 
Section 2.15 "Developer" shall mean and refer to River Bend Landing, LLC, and /or its 
subsidiaries. 
 
Section 2.16 "Interior Lot" shall mean and refer to any lot not touching or containing land at the 
87 foot elevation. 
 
Section 2.17 "Lot" shall mean and refer to a parcel of land designated as a lot on any Plat of 
Legacy Shores. 
 
Section 2.18 "Lot Front" shall mean the side of the Lot which faces the road in the subdivision 
by which the Owner accesses his Lot. 
 
Section 2.19 "Maintenance Fund" shall mean and refer to the fund created by Assessments and 
fees levied pursuant to Article IV below to provide the Association with the funds required to 
carry out its duties under these Covenants. 
 
Section 2.20 "Member" shall mean and refer to any person or entity holding Membership in the 
Association. 



Section 2.21 "Membership" shall mean and refer to the rights and responsibilities of every 
Owner of any Lot in Legacy Shores. Every Owner by virtue of being an Owner and only as long 
as he or she is an Owner, shall retain their Membership in the Association. The Membership may 
not be separated from Ownership of any Lot. Regardless of the number of individuals holding 
legal title to a Lot, no more than one Membership shall be allowed per Lot owned. However, all 
individuals owning such Lot shall be entitled to the rights of Membership and the use and 
enjoyment appurtenant to such Ownership, but if the number of individual Owners exceeds four 
(4), Legacy Shores Homeowners Association, by its Directors, may limit these rights as they see 
fit. 
 
Section 2.22 "Owner" shall mean and refer to the record Owner, whether one or more persons or 
entities, of fee simple title to any Lot, but shall not mean or refer to any person or entity who 
holds such interest merely as security for the performance of a debt or other obligation, including 
a Mortgage, unless and until such person or entity has acquired fee simple title pursuant to 
foreclosure or other proceeding. 
 
Section 2.23 "Plat" shall mean and refer to any plat (or as built survey) depicting the Property 
filed in the Probate Office for Wilcox County, Alabama, as such plat may be amended from time 
to time. 
 
Section 2.24 "Recreational Lot" shall mean and refer to any lot which is intended solely for the 
purpose of dock construction, and not for home construction, as designated on the Plat. 
 
Section 2.25 "Supplemental Covenants" shall mean and refer to additional or further restrictive 
covenants imposed on a portion or portions of the Property from time to time. 
 
Section 2.26 "Legacy Shores" shall mean and refer to the planned community created by these 
Covenants, consisting of the Property and all of the Improvements located on the Property. 
 
Section 2.27 "Legacy Shores Documents" shall mean and refer to the basic documents creating 
and governing Legacy Shores Homeowners Association, including but not limited to these 
Covenants, the Articles and By-Laws of the Association, the Architectural Guidelines and any 
procedures, rules, regulations or policies adopted under such documents by the Association or 
the Architectural Review Committee. 
 
Section 2.28 "Legacy Shores Rules" shall mean and refer to the rules adopted by the Association 
as provided in Section 3.06 below. 
 
Section 2.29 "Voting Unit' shall mean and refer to any one of the interests in the Property 
designated in Section 3.02 below to which a right to vote in Association matters is allocated. 
 
Section 2.30 "Manager" shall mean and refer to an individual who may be employed or render 
services pursuant to Section 3.07. 
 
Section 2.31 "Waterfront Lot" shall mean and refer to any individual lot within Legacy Shores 
Subdivision that touches on or contains land at the 87' elevation. 



ARTICLE III 
THE ASSOCIATION 

 
Section 3.01 Developer as The Association. Until such time as ninety-five percent (95%) of the 
lots in Legacy Shores Subdivision are deeded to individual lot purchasers, and the Association is 
operative, the Developer, at its sole discretion, shall act and have the authority to act as the 
Association and have such rights and such obligations as are created herein. 
 
Section 3.02 Voting Rights. Every Owner by virtue of being an Owner and only as long as he or 
she is an Owner, shall be a Member of the Association. 
 
(a) Vote: Each member shall have one vote, in person or by proxy at a meeting of the Members; 
provided, however, that if two or more Members have or hold common or joint Ownership to 
any Lot in Legacy Shores Subdivision, only one vote shall be cast for each Lot with common or 
joint Ownership, and further provided that if an individual or organization owns more than one 
(1) Lot they shall have one (1) vote for each Lot owned. The designation of any absentee ballot 
shall be made in writing to the Secretary of the Association, and shall be revocable at any time 
by written notice to the Secretary, by the Member or Members so designated. 
 
(b) Government: Board of Directors. Because the number of Lots in this subdivision restricts the 
maximum number of Members in the Association, it is hereby provided that the officers of the 
Association shall also serve as its Board of Directors. 
 

(i) Officers: The Officers of the Association shall consist of a President, Vice- President, 
Secretary, Treasurer, and an ARC Liaison and they shall be elected as provided in 
subsection (d) of this Section 3.02. 

 
(ii) The officers of the Association must be Members of the Association and shall be 

elected by the Board of Directors at the annual meeting of the Members of the 
Association. The term of each officer shall be for two (2) years, except the initial term 
of the President and Vice-President will be for one (1) year terms to create an 
alternating Board. 

 
(c) Meetings. Annual meeting of Members. The annual meeting of Members of the Association 
shall be held at a time and place fixed by the officers of the Association. Notice of the time and 
place of holding the annual meeting shall be mailed to each Member not less than ten (10) nor 
more than fifty (50) days before the date of the meeting. Regular annual meetings of the 
Association shall be held on either the Saturday or the Sunday of the second weekend of October 
at an hour and location set by the Board of Directors. 
 

(i) Special meeting of the Association. The President may call special meetings of the 
association. In addition, the President shall call a special meeting of the association 
when directed by majority vote of the Board of Directors, or when requested by a 
petition signed by at least ten percent (10%) of the Members of the Association. 
Notice of a special meeting shall be mailed to each Member not less than ten (10) nor 



more than fifty (50) days before the date of the meeting, and at such special meeting 
there shall only be considered such business as is specified in the notice of meeting. 

 
(ii) Quorum for Meeting of Members. At all meetings of the Association, either annual or 

special, a majority of all Members appearing in person or voting by absentee ballot 
shall constitute a quorum. 

 
(iii) Order of Business. At all meetings of the Association, the agenda of business shall be 

as follows: 
 

(A) Reading of minutes of immediately prior meeting for information and approval; 
(B) Reports of Officers; 
(C) Reports of Committees; 
(D) Unfinished Business; 
(E) New Business; 
(F) Reading and approval of minutes of meeting just had, if requested. 

 
(iv) Actions. Unless otherwise provided for herein or by special vote of the Association, a 

majority vote of those Members present when a vote is taken will be sufficient to 
transact the Association business. 

 
(v) Location. Meetings of the Association shall be held at a suitable place convenient to 

the Members and such place shall be specified in the notice of the meeting. 
 
(d) Elections. The term of an officer of the Association shall be two (2) years and they shall be 
elected by plurality vote of the Board of Directors at the annual meeting of the Association. No 
Member may serve as an officer in the same office more than two (2) consecutive terms. 
 

(i) Vacancies. If a vacancy occurs among the officers, the Board of Directors shall fill 
said vacancy for the remainder of said officer's term. 

 
(ii) Removal. Any officer may be removed from office for cause, by the vote of Members 

of the Association constituting three-fourths (3/4) of the Members of the Association 
present or by absentee ballot at a regular or special meeting of the Association. 

 
Section 3.03 Duties of Officers. 
 
(a) President. The President shall preside at all meetings of the Association and shall appoint 
such committees, as he/she or the Association shall consider expedient or necessary. 
 
(b) Vice-President. In the absence of the President, the Vice-President shall perform his/her 
duties. The Vice-President shall also generally assist the President and exercise such other 
powers and perform such other duties as shall be prescribed by the Association. 
 
(c) Secretary. The Secretary shall keep the minutes of all meetings of the Association and shall, 
if requested, read such minutes at the close of each meeting for approval; and shall mail out all 



notices for meetings of the Association. He/she shall perform such other duties as may be 
required of him by the By-Laws, and the President or the Association. 
 
(d) Treasurer. The Treasurer shall have charge of all receipts and monies of the Association, 
deposit them in the name of the Association in a bank approved by the Association, and disburse 
funds as ordered or authorized by the Association. He/she shall keep regular accounts of his/her 
receipts and disbursements, submit his record when requested and give an itemized statement at 
regular meetings of the Association. He/she, or the President or Vice-President, may sign checks 
and withdrawal slips on behalf of the Association upon any and all of its bank accounts. He/she 
shall be authorized to sign checks and withdraw funds from Association accounts on behalf of 
the Association in an amount approved by the Association at its first meeting. 
 
(e) ARC Liaison. The ARC Liaison shall have charge of all communication and dissemination of 
policy or actions required between the Officers of the Association and the ARC. 
 
(f) Execution of Instruments. The President and the Secretary or the Treasurer, shall, on being so 
directed by the Association, sign on behalf of the Association all leases, contracts, or other 
instruments in writing. 
 
Section 3.04 Management of Association. 
 
(a) The Officers of the Association acting in the form of a Board of Directors shall have general 
charge and management of the affairs, funds and property of the Association. Said Board of 
Directors shall have full power, and it shall be the duty to carry out the purposes of the 
Association according to its Articles of Incorporation and By-Laws. The Board of Directors shall 
have authority to approve expenditures on behalf of the Association in an amount to be approved 
by the association as its first meeting. 
 
(b) The Board of Directors may make reasonable rules for the conduct of the Members and their 
guests for the use of Association's property and facilities not provided for herein or in the By- 
Laws or the individual deeds by Declarant for Lots in Legacy Shores Subdivision. 
 
(c) The Board of Directors, at its discretion, shall set times and days for their meetings as agreed 
by a majority of the Board. There shall be no need for formal written notice of the meeting but 
rather, it will be left to the President of the Association, who shall serve as the Chairperson of the 
Board of Directors, to schedule meetings of the Board when necessary. 
 
Section 3.05 Compliance with Documents. Each Owner shall abide by and benefit from these 
Covenants, the Associations' By-Laws and Legacy Shores Documents. 
 
(a) Fines. A schedule of fines for infractions of these Restrictions, the By-Laws of Legacy 
Shores or any of Legacy Shores Documents, shall be available to each Member of the 
Association for the cost of copying such documents. A summary of any change in Legacy Shores 
Rules shall be distributed to each Member within a reasonable time following the effective date 
of the change. 



Section 3.06 Rules and Regulations. The Association, from time to time and subject to Legacy 
Shores Documents, may adopt, amend and repeal rules and regulations, to be known as "Legacy 
Shores Rules". 
 
Section 3.07 Manager. The Association may employ or contract for the services of a Manager, 
provided that no such employment shall be by a contract having a term of more than three (3) 
years, and each such contract shall be subject to cancellation by the Association upon ninety (90) 
days or less prior notice without cause and without payment of a termination fee. The Manager 
shall not have the authority to make expenditures for additions or improvements chargeable 
against the Maintenance Fund except upon specific prior approval and direction by the Board. 
The Board shall not be liable for any omission or improper exercise by a Manager of any such 
duty, power or function so delegated by written instrument executed by or on behalf of the 
Board. 
 
Section 3.08 Ownership of Personal and Real Property for Common Use. The Association, 
through action of its Board, may acquire, hold and dispose of tangible and intangible personal 
property and real property. The Board, acting on behalf of the Association, may accept any real 
or personal property, leasehold or other property interest within Legacy Shores conveyed to the 
Association. 
 
Section 3.09 Roads and Streets. All roads leading from County Road 29 and all roads within 
Legacy Shores are intended to be private roads, and are subject to the terms of that certain 
easement to Weyerhaeuser Company, its successors and assigns, as evidenced by document 
recorded in Deed Book #1 1E, Page 466, in the Probate Records of Wilcox County, Alabama, 
and also subject to an easement to Dan Deason and Mike Deason, their successors and assigns, 
as evidenced by document recorded in Deed Book _______, Page _______, in the Probate 
Records of Wilcox County, Alabama. Subject to said easement, such private roads shall be for 
the sole use and enjoyment of Lot Owners and shall be maintained by the Association. Private 
driveways located on the Property shall be maintained by the Owners of the Lots on which they 
are located and serve. 
 
3.09.1 Specific Easement for the benefit of certain Lots within the Property. In addition to the 
roads within the Property, the following easements have been established by the Developer for 
the benefit of certain lots for ingress-egress and utilities, as shown on the recorded plat thereof: 
 
(a) An easement across Lots 2 through 7 for the benefit of Lots 2 through 8, as shown on the 
Plat. Said easement shall be jointly maintained by the Owners of Lots 1 through 8 and the cost of 
such maintenance shall be borne equally by the Owners of said lots. In the event either of the 
Owners shall fail or refuse to cooperate in the joint maintenance or shall fail or refuse to 
reimburse the other Owners for its reasonable expenses in maintaining said easement after 
reasonable written notice, that Owner shall forfeit its interest in the easement, and shall be 
responsible for constructing its own driveway across its own property to the private easement 
leading to County Road 29. 
 
 



(b) An easement across Lot 2 for the benefit of Lot 1, as shown on the Plat. Said easement shall 
be maintained by the Owner of Lot 1. Failure of the Owner of Lot 1 to maintain such easement 
shall result in the forfeiture of its interest in the easement, and said Owner shall be responsible 
for constructing its own driveway across its own property to the private easement leading to 
County Road 29. 
 
(c) An easement across Lot 48 for the benefit of Lot 9 only, as shown on the Plat. Said easement 
shall be maintained by the Owner of Lot 9. Failure of the Owner of Lot 9 to maintain such 
easement shall result in the forfeiture of its interest in the easement, and said Owner shall be 
responsible for constructing its own driveway across its own property to the private easement 
leading to County Road 29. 
 
(d) An easement across Lots 11, 12 13 and 49 for the benefit of Lots 10, 11, 12 13 and 49, as 
shown on the Flat. Said easement shall be jointly maintained by the Owners of Lots 10, 11, 12, 
13 and 49 and the cost of such maintenance shall be borne equally by the Owners of said Lots. In 
the event any of the Owners shall fail or refuse to cooperate in the joint maintenance or shall fail 
or refuse to reimburse the other Owners for its reasonable expenses in maintaining said easement 
after reasonable written notice, that Owner shall forfeit its interest in the easement, and shall be 
responsible for constructing its own driveway across its own property to the private easement 
leading to County Road 29. 
 
(e) An easement across Lots 15, 16, 17, 27A, 44A, 45A, 46A, 48A, 49A, 50A and 69A for the 
benefit of said Lots, as shown on the Plat. Said easement shall be jointly maintained by the 
Owners of the named Lots and the cost of such maintenance shall be borne equally by the 
Owners of said Lots. In the event any of the Owners shall fail or refuse to cooperate in the joint 
maintenance or shall fail or refuse to reimburse the other Owners for its reasonable expenses in 
maintaining said easement after reasonable written notice, such cost may be assessed against the 
Lot as provided in Section 4.01 of these Covenants. 
 
(f) An easement across Lots 41 and 42 for the use and benefit of said Lots, and the use and 
benefit of the property owner(s) to the south of said Lots, as shown on the Plat. Said easement 
shall be maintained by the Association and the cost of such maintenance shall be borne by the 
Association. Costs of maintenance due to use of this easement by the property owner(s) to the 
south may be passed along to such property owner(s) to the south by separate agreement. 
 
(g) An easement across Lots 39, 40, 32A, 33A, 43A, 54A, 55A, 56A, 57A,,58A, 59A, 60A, 61A, 
62A, 63A, 64A, 65A, 66A, 67A and 68A, for the use and benefit of said Lots, as shown on the 
Plat. Said easement shall be jointly maintained by the Owners of the named Lots and the cost of 
such maintenance shall be borne equally by the Owners of said Lots. In the event any of the 
Owners shall fail or refuse to cooperate in the joint maintenance or shall fail or refuse to 
reimburse the other Owners for their reasonable expenses in maintaining said easement after 
reasonable written notice, such cost may be assessed against the Lot as provided in Section 4.01 
of these Covenants. 
 
 



Section 3.10 Association Records. Upon written request to the Association by any Owner of a 
Lot or any Mortgagee or guarantor of a first mortgage on any Lot, or the insurer of 
improvements on any Lot, the Association shall make available for inspection, current copies of 
the Association's documents, books, records and financial statements. The Association shall also 
make available to prospective purchasers current copies of the Association's documents, 
including rules governing the use of Lots and the most recent annual financial statement, if such 
is prepared. "Available" as used herein shall mean available for inspection, upon written request, 
during normal business hours. 
 
Section 3.11 Successor to Declarant. The Association shall succeed to all of the rights, duties and 
responsibilities of the Developer under these Covenants. The Association may delegate any of 
such rights, duties or responsibilities to the ARC or to any other committee or entity, which it 
may choose to form. 
 
Section 3.12 Access to Houses for Maintenance, Repair and Emergencies. Declarant, its 
successors and assigns, should the Board of Directors fail to act, shall have the irrevocable right 
to have access to each Lot and the house or dwelling on each Lot, from time to time during 
reasonable hours as may be necessary, for the maintenance of any Lot or the Maintenance, repair 
or replacement of any structure on the Lot. Such right of access shall be immediate for the 
making of emergency repairs thereon or therein in order to prevent property damage or personal 
injury. All damaged Lots shall be timely restored to substantially the same condition in which 
they existed prior to the damage. All maintenance, repairs or replacements pertaining to any Lot 
or any structure thereon shall be the expense of the Owner thereof. These Covenants establish no 
duty upon the Association, the Board or Declarant to maintain, repair or replace any Lot or any 
structure thereon, and this Section 3.12 vests no rights in Owners or any other person as against 
the Board, the Association or Declarant. 
 

ARTICLE IV 
COVENANT FOR MAINTENANCE ASSESSMENTS 

 
Section 4.01 Creation of the Lien and Personal Obligation for Assessments. Each Owner of any 
Lot, by acceptance of a deed therefor, whether or not it shall be so expressed in any such deed, is 
deemed to covenant and agree to pay to the Association: (1) Annual Assessments or charges as 
provided in these Covenants for the purpose of funding the Maintenance Fund; (2) special 
Assessments for capital improvements and other purposes as stated in these Covenants, such 
annual and special Assessments to be fixed, established and collected from time to time as 
provided below; and (3) Default assessments which may be assessed against an Owner's Lot 
pursuant to Legacy Shores Documents for failure to perform an obligation under Legacy Shores 
Documents or because the Association or Declarant has incurred an expense on behalf of the 
Owner under Legacy Shores Documents. The annual, special and Default assessments, together 
with interest, costs and reasonable attorneys' fees, shall be a charge on the land and shall be a 
continuing lien upon the Lot against which each such Assessment is made until paid. Each such 
Assessment, together with interest, costs and reasonable attorneys’ fees, shall also be the 
personal obligation of the Owner of such Lot at the time when the Assessment fell due. 
 



Section 4.02 Default Assessments. All monetary fines assessed against an Owner pursuant to 
Legacy Shores Documents, or any expense of the Association which is the obligation of an 
Owner or which is incurred by the Association or Declarant on behalf of the Owner pursuant to 
Legacy Shores Documents, shall be a Default Assessment and shall become a lien against such 
Owner's Lot which may be foreclosed or otherwise collected as provided in these Covenants. 
Notice of the amount and due date of such Default Assessment shall be sent to the Owner subject 
to such Assessment at least thirty (30) days prior to the due date, provided that failure to give 
such thirty (30) days prior notice shall not constitute a waiver thereof, but shall only postpone the 
due date for payment thereof until the expiration of said thirty (30) day period. 
 
Section 4.03 Effect of Nonpayment of Assessment; Lien; Remedies of Association. Any 
Assessment, whether pertaining to annual, special or Default Assessments, which is not paid 
within thirty (30) days of its due date shall be delinquent. In the event that an Assessment 
becomes delinquent, the Association, in its sole discretion, may take any or all of the following 
actions: 
 
(a) Assess a late charge of at least fifteen (15%) percent per delinquency; 
 
(b) Assess an interest charge from the date of delinquency at the rate per annum of two points 
above the prime rate charged by the Association's bank, or such other rate as shall have been 
established by the Board; 
 
(c) Suspend the voting rights of the Owner during any period of delinquency; 
 
(d) Accelerate any unpaid annual Assessments for the fiscal year such that they shall be due and 
payable at once; 
 
(e) Bring an action at law against any Owner personally obligated to pay the delinquent 
installments; or 
 
(f) File a statement of lien with respect of the Lot, and foreclose as set forth in more detail below. 
The Association may file a statement of lien by recording with the Probate Office for Wilcox 
County, Alabama, a written statement with respect to the Lot, setting forth the name of the 
Owner, the legal description of the Lot, the name of the Association and the amount of 
delinquent Assessments then owing, which statement shall be duly signed and acknowledged by 
the President or Vice-President of the Board of the Association or by the Manager, and which 
shall be served upon the Owner of the Lot by registered mail to the address of the Lot or at such 
other address as the Association may have in its records for the Owner. Thirty (30) days 
following the mailing of such notice, the Association may proceed to foreclose the said lien in 
the same manner as provided for foreclosure of mortgages under the statutes of the State of 
Alabama. Such lien shall be in favor of the Association and shall be for the benefit of all other 
Owners. In either a personal or foreclosure action, the Association shall be entitled to recover as 
a part of the action the interest, costs and reasonable attorneys' fees with respect to the action. No 
Owner may waive or otherwise escape liability for the Assessments provided for herein by 
abandonment of his Lot. The remedies herein provided shall not be exclusive, and the 



Association may enforce any other remedies to collect delinquent Assessments as may be 
provided by law. 
 
Section 4.04 Successor's Liability for Assessments. Each Owner shall be personally obligated to 
pay all Assessments assessed against all Lots Owned by them during the time of his/her 
Ownership, together with all interest, fees, and costs properly added thereto, pursuant to these 
Covenants. The payment by a subsequent Owner of any and all unpaid Assessments, interest, 
late charges, costs, expenses and attorneys' fees against such Lot for a time period prior to his 
acquisition of his Ownership shall vest in subsequent Owner such right to recover from any prior 
Owner any amounts paid by such successor. In addition, such successor shall be entitled to rely 
on the statement of the status of Assessments issued by or on behalf of the Association. 
 
Section 4.05 Subordination of the Lien. The lien of the Assessments on a Lot provided for in 
these Covenants shall be subordinate to the lien of any First Mortgage on that Lot regardless of 
the time of filing of such first mortgage. The lien of the Assessments shall be superior to and 
prior to any homestead exemption provided now or in the future by the laws of the State of 
Alabama. No judicial sale or transfer shall relieve the purchaser or transferee of a Lot from 
liability for, nor the Lot from the lien of, any Assessments made after the sale or transfer. 
 
Section 4.06 Maximum Annual Assessments. Until January 1 of the year immediately following 
the formation of the Homeowners Association, the maximum annual Assessment per Lot shall be 
as follows: The maximum annual Assessment for each residential Lot shall be $475.00 per year. 
The Developer, and/or its assigns will not be required to pay any Association fees or annual 
assessments on the unsold Lots. The purpose of the assessments by the Declarant, and/or its 
assigns is to maintain common roads, driveways, entrances, signs, and any other obligation the 
Declarant, and/or its assigns sees fit or is provided for in Legacy Shores Documents. This fee 
will be assessed January 1 of each year and shall begin January 1 of the immediate year 
following closing on each parcel. The Declarant shall have the right to use said funds at its sole 
discretion for maintenance purposes until such time as the Homeowners Association has been 
turned over to the property Owners. 
 
(a) From and after January 1 of the year immediately following the conveyance of the first Lot to 
an Owner, the maximum annual Assessment may be increased each year by the Board of 
Directors, or the Association, or the Developer if the Association is not operative, by not more 
than five (5%) percent above the maximum assessment for the previous year without a vote of 
the Homeowners Association. 
 
(b) From and after January 1 of the year immediately following the formation of the 
Homeowners Association, the maximum annual Assessment to be levied against all Members 
may be increased above five (5%) percent by a vote of two-thirds (2/3) of Members who are 
voting in person or by absentee ballot at a meeting duly called for this purpose. 
 
(c) The Board may fix the annual assessment at an amount not in excess of the maximum. 
 
 



Section 4.07 Notice and Quorum for any meeting to increase annual Assessment under Section 
4.05. Written notice of any meeting called for the purpose of taking any action authorized under 
Sections 4.06 shall be sent to all Members not less than thirty (30) days nor more than sixty (60) 
days in advance of the meeting. At such meeting, the presence of Members or of Absentee 
Ballots constituting a majority of all votes of Members shall constitute a quorum. 
 

ARTICLE V 
PROPERTY RIGHTS OF OWNERS 

 
Section 5.01 Utility Easements. There is hereby created and reserved a general twenty (20) foot 
wide easement along all Lot Front boundary lines and a general ten (10) foot wide easement 
along all other Lot boundary lines as delineated on subdivision survey recorded in the Probate 
Office for Wilcox County upon, across, over, in, and under the Property for ingress and egress 
and for installation, replacement, repair and maintenance of all utilities, including but not  
limited to water, sewer, gas, telephone, electricity, and any future utility such as gas, cable, fiber- 
optics, etc., and for any other legitimate purpose as determined by the Developer. By virtue of 
this easement it shall be expressly permissible and proper for the companies providing 
electricity, telephone, and other communication services to install and maintain necessary 
equipment on the Property and to affix and maintain electricity, communications, and telephone 
wires, conduits and circuits under the Property. No water, sewer, telephone, electricity, or other 
lines, systems, or facilities may be installed or relocated on the surface of the Property unless 
approved by the Architectural Review Committee. Such utilities temporarily may be installed 
above ground during construction, if approved by the Architectural Review Committee. Should 
any utility company furnishing a service covered by this general easement request a specific 
easement by separate recordable documents, the Association shall have the right and authority to 
grant such easement upon, across, over or under any part or all of the Property over which said 
easement has been created and reserved without conflicting with the terms of these Covenants. 
This general easement shall in no way affect, avoid, extinguish or modify any other recorded 
easement on the Property. 
 
Section 5.02 Emergency Easement. A general easement is hereby granted to all police, sheriff, 
fire protection, ambulance and other similar emergency agencies or person to enter upon all 
streets and upon the Property in the proper performance of their duties. 
 
Section 5.03 Maintenance Easement. An easement is hereby reserved to the Association and any 
member of the Board or the Manager, and their respective officers, agents, employees and 
assigns, upon, across, over, in and under the Lots, and a right to make such use of the Lots, as 
may be necessary or appropriate to make emergency repairs or to perform the duties and 
functions which the Association is obligated or permitted to perform pursuant to Legacy Shores 
Documents, including the right to enter upon any Lot or Building site for the purpose of 
performing maintenance to the landscaping or the exterior of improvements on such Lot or 
Building Site as required by Legacy Shores Documents. 
 
Section 5.04 Drainage Easement. An easement is hereby reserved to the Association, its officers, 
agents, employees, successors and assigns to enter upon, across, over, in and under any portion 
of the Property for the purpose of changing, correcting or otherwise modifying the grade or 



drainage channels on the Property so as to improve the drainage of water. Best efforts shall be 
made to use this easement so as not to disturb the uses of the Owners and the Association, as 
applicable, to the extent possible, to prosecute such drainage work promptly and expeditiously, 
and to restore any areas affected by such work to a sightly and usable conditions as soon as 
reasonably possible following such work. Any changes must have the prior approval of the 
Board prior to undertaking such drainage work, which approval shall not be unreasonably 
withheld. 
 
Section 5.05 Partition or Combination of Lots. No part of a Lot may be partitioned or separated 
from any other part thereof, and no Lots may be combined, except as provided in this Section. A 
Lot may not be subdivided to create an additional Lot in the subdivision. A Lot may be 
subdivided if each portion is subsequently combined with other adjacent lots, with the written 
consent of the Association and full compliance with all applicable state and county zoning and 
subdivision regulations and all applicable Legacy Shores Documents. However, two (2) or more 
Lots may be combined into one, with the written consent of the Association and full compliance 
with all applicable state and county zoning and subdivision regulations and all applicable Legacy 
Shores Documents. Association's consent shall be conditioned upon payment by the Owner or 
Owners concerned of all expenses incident to giving the consent, including legal and accounting 
fees. Every agreement and recorded instrument for combination of Lots shall make adequate 
provisions for the adjustment of voting rights and liability for payment of Assessments 
appurtenant to or imposed on such Lots. Whether combined or unchanged, each Lot shall be 
conveyed, transferred, gifted, devised, bequeathed, encumbered or otherwise disposed of, as the 
case may be, with all appurtenant rights and interests created by law or these Covenants, 
including the Owner's Membership in the Association, and with the appropriate adjustments in 
the voting rights, as provided in Section 3.02 above, and liability for Assessments as established 
for such type of Lot by the Board of Directors being made as applicable. 
 
Section 5.06 Easement. Declarant expressly reserves for its benefit a nonexclusive easement for 
ingress, egress, access over, under, and across the Property, or any portion thereof, to complete 
any improvement, or to complete any Lot(s), which Declarant deems desirable to implement 
Declarant's development plan. 
 

ARTICLE VI 
ARCHITECTURAL REVIEW COMMITTEE 

 
Section 6.01 Membership. There is hereby established an Architectural Review Committee 
(ARC) which shall be responsible for the establishment and administration of the Architectural 
Guidelines to carry out the purposes and intent of these Covenants. The ARC shall be composed 
of three (3) persons of which a minimum of two (2) must be Members who are in good standing 
with the Association. All of the Members of the ARC shall be appointed, removed and replaced 
by the Board. The ARC is the only standing committee of the Board that has perpetual existence. 
A member of the ARC shall serve as a liaison to the Board. Until such time as the ARC is 
functional, the Developer and/or its successors and assigns shall act as the ARC, having such 
duties, rights and obligations as created herein. 
 



Section 6.02 Purpose. The ARC shall review, study and either approve, with conditions, or reject 
proposed improvements on the Property, all in compliance with these Covenants and as further 
set forth in the Architectural Guidelines adopted and established from time to time by the ARC 
and approved by the Board. 
 
(a) The ARC shall exercise its best judgment to see that all improvements conform and 
harmonize with any existing structures as to external design, quality and type of construction, 
materials, color, location of the Building Site, height, grade and finished ground elevation, and 
aesthetic considerations set forth in these Covenants or in the Architectural Guidelines. 
 
(b) No improvements on the Property shall be erected, placed or altered on any Lot, Building 
Site, or dock, nor shall any construction be commenced, until plans for such improvements shall 
have been approved by the ARC; provided, however, that improvements and alterations which 
are completely within a building may be undertaken without such approval. Subdividing or 
combining lots will not change the voting rights or association fees of the resulting changed lots 
to be one (1) vote and one (1) fee per revised lot. 
 
(c) The actions of the ARC in the exercise of its discretion by its approval with conditions or 
disapproval of plans or other information submitted to it, or with respect to any other matter 
before it, shall be conclusive and binding on all interested parties subject to appeal as provided in 
the By-Laws. 
 
Section 6.03 Organization and operation of the ARC. 
 
(a) Term. The term of office of each Member of the ARC, subject to Section 6.1, shall be two (2) 
years, except the initial term of two (2) ARC Members which will be for one (1) year each to 
create an alternating board, commencing on January 1 of each year and continuing until his or 
her successor shall have been appointed. Should an ARC Member die, retire or become 
incapacitated, or in the event of a temporary absence of an ARC Member, a successor may be 
appointed as provided in Section 6.01. 
 
(b) ARC Officers. The ARC shall elect a Chairperson, a Vice-Chairperson, and a Secretary. The 
Vice-Chairperson shall act as the ARC Liaison. 
 
(c) Operations. The Chairperson shall preside over and conduct all meetings and shall provide 
for reasonable notice to each Member of the ARC prior to any meeting. The notice shall set forth 
the time and place of the meeting and notice may be waived by any ARC Member. In the 
absence of a chairperson, the party responsible for appointing or electing the chairperson may 
appoint or elect a successor, or, if the absence is temporary, the Vice-Chairperson shall serve as a 
temporary successor. 
 
(d) Voting. The affirmative vote of a majority of the Members of the ARC shall govern its 
actions and be the act of the ARC. A quorum shall consist of a majority of the ARC Members. 
 
(e) Expert Consultation. The ARC may avail itself of technical and professional advice and 
consultants, as it deems appropriate. 



Section 6.04 Expenses. Except as provided below, all expenses of the ARC shall be paid by the 
Association. The ARC shall have the right to charge a fee for each application submitted to it for 
review in an amount, which may be established by the ARC from time to time, and such fees 
shall be collected by the ARC and remitted to the Association to help defray the expenses of the 
ARC's operation. Until December 31, 2009, the filing fee shall not exceed Three Hundred and 
No/100 Dollars ($300.00) per dwelling unit but may be subject to reasonable increase after that 
date, as determined by the Board on recommendation from the ARC. 
 
Section 6.05 Architectural Guidelines. The ARC shall, subject to Board approval: adopt, 
establish and publish from time to time Architectural Guidelines, which shall be a Legacy Shores 
Document. Prior to approving material changes to the Architectural Guidelines, the ARC shall 
distribute pending changes to the Membership for comment. If, within 30 days after the mailing 
of said pending changes, 10% or more of the membership of the association request a hearing 
(meeting) in writing, a hearing will be called by the ARC for open discussion; otherwise the 
changes will become effective at the end of the 30-day interval. If a hearing has been held, the 
ARC and the Board will reconsider the changes and take another vote as appropriate. The 
Architectural Guidelines are subject to the approval of the Board and shall not be inconsistent 
with these Covenants, but shall more specifically define and describe the design standards for 
Legacy Shores and the various uses within Legacy Shores. Further, the ARC, in it sole 
discretion, may excuse compliance with such requirements as are not necessary or appropriate in 
specific situations and may permit compliance with different or alternative requirements, 
provided however, all such exceptions or excused compliance must be approved by the Board. 
Compliance with Legacy Shores design review process is not a substitute and each Owner is 
responsible for obtaining all approvals, licenses and permits as may be required prior to 
commencing construction, and subsequent compliance with any government agency 
requirements for sediment control and ground water protection. 
 
Section 6.06 Procedures. As part of the Architectural Guidelines, the ARC shall make and 
publish such rules and regulations, as it may deem appropriate to govern its proceedings. 
Appeals shall be conducted as provided in the By-Laws. 
 
Section 6.07 Limitation of Liability. The ARC shall use reasonable judgment in accepting or 
disapproving all plans and specifications submitted to it. Neither the ARC nor any individual 
ARC Member shall be liable to any person for any official act of the ARC in connection with 
submitted plans and specifications except to the extent the ARC or any individual ARC Member 
acted with malice or wrongful intent. Approval by the ARC does not necessarily assure approval 
by the appropriate governmental board or commission for Wilcox County, Alabama. 
Notwithstanding that the ARC has approved plans and specifications, neither the ARC nor any of 
its Members shall be responsible or liable to any Owner, developer, or contractor with respect to 
any loss, liability, claim or expense which may arise by reason of such approval of the 
construction of the improvements. Neither the Board of Directors, the ARC nor any agent thereof 
shall be responsible in any way for any defects in any plans or specifications submitted, revised 
or approved in accordance with the provisions of Legacy Shores Documents, nor for any 
structural or other defects in any work done according to such plans and specifications. In all 
events, the ARC shall be defended and indemnified by the Association in any such suit or 
proceeding, which may arise by reason of the ARC's decision. The Association, however, shall 



not be obligated to indemnify each Member of the ARC to the extent any such Member of the 
ARC shall be adjudged to be liable for negligence or misconduct in the performance of his duty 
as a Member of the ARC, unless and then only to the extent that the court in such action or suit 
may be brought shall determine upon application that, despite the adjudication of liability but in 
view of all circumstances of the case, such person is fairly and reasonable entitled to 
indemnification for such expenses as such court shall deem proper. 
 
Section 6.08 Penalties for Violations or Non-compliance. The ARC may seek any and all legal or 
equitable remedies available to it in the event of a violation of the Architectural Guidelines or 
non-compliance with such guidelines by an Owner. The ARC may assess fines against an Owner 
for each event of non-compliance or violation, and collection of such shall be subject to 
enforcement under all provisions contained herein, including those that provide for such sums 
owed to become a lien on the Lot in question. Fines are defined in the Architectural Guidelines. 
 
Section 6.09 Certificate of Compliance. Upon payment of a reasonable fee established from time 
to time by the Board, and upon written request of any Owner or his agent, an existing or 
prospective Mortgagee or a prospective grantee, the ARC shall issue an acknowledged 
certificate, in recordable form, setting forth generally whether, to the best of the ARC's 
knowledge, the Owner is in violation of any of the terms and conditions of Legacy Shores 
Documents. Unless such request shall be complied with within thirty (30) days after receipt of 
the request, it shall be conclusively presumed that the Owner and the Owner's improvements are 
in conformance with all the terms and conditions subject to the control of the ARC. 
 

ARTICLE VII 
CONSTRUCTION AND ALTERATION OF IMPROVEMENTS 

 
Section 7.01 General. The Architectural Guidelines and the general instructions set forth in these 
Covenants shall govern the right of an Owner, developer, or other entity to construct, reconstruct, 
refinish, alter or maintain any improvement upon, under or above any of the Property (except as 
provided in Section 6.02 above), and to make or create any excavation or fill on the Property, or 
make any change in the natural or existing surface contour or drainage, or install any utility line 
or conduit on or over the Property. 
 
Section 7.02 Approval Required. Except to the extent permitted in Section 6.02 above, any 
construction, reconstruction, refinishing or alteration or any part of the exterior of any Building 
or other improvement on the Property is absolutely prohibited until and unless the Owner first 
obtains approval from the ARC and otherwise complies with the provisions of these Covenants. 
All improvements shall be constructed only in accordance with approved plans. 
 
Section 7.03 Deemed Nuisances. Every violation of these Covenants is hereby declared to be and 
to constitute a nuisance, and every public or private remedy allowed for such violation by law or 
equity against a Member shall be applicable. These Covenants may also be enforced as provided 
below. 
 
Section 7.04 Removal of Nonconforming Improvements. The Association, upon 
recommendation of the ARC and after reasonable notice to the offender and to the Lot Owner, 



may remove any improvement constructed, reconstructed, refinished, altered or maintained in 
violation of these Covenants, and the Owner of the improvement shall immediately reimburse 
the Association for all expenses incurred in connection with such removal. 
 
Section 7.05 Construction Methods. Specific rules regarding construction methods, including but 
not limited to excavation, drainage, utility lines, loading areas, waste storage, trash removal, 
materials storage and transformers and meters shall be set forth in the Architectural Guidelines, 
and all Owners shall comply with those rules. 
 

ARTICLE VIII 
GENERAL COVENANTS AND RESTRICTIONS 

 
The Association, acting through its Board of Directors, shall have authority to make and to 
enforce standards and restrictions governing the use of Lots. Such regulations and use 
restrictions shall be binding upon all Owners and occupants until and unless overruled, cancelled 
or modified in accordance with the amendment provisions of these Covenants. 
 
Land use standards constituting the initial restrictions and standards were established by the 
Developer. Unless otherwise indicated, all such restrictions and standards apply to all Lots. 
 
Section 8.01 Residential use Only. The Lots (other than Lots which are identified on the Plat as 
"Recreation Lots") shall be used for single family residential purposes only; except, however, an 
Owner may construct a guest house or houses, if the Lot is large enough to accommodate same. 
Such guest houses must be in harmony with the family residence and be approved by the ARC. 
The Lot Owners cannot subdivide the Lot to sell the guest houses and no commercial use shall 
be permitted. This restriction shall not be construed to prevent rental of any Dwelling for private 
residential purposes or to prevent an individual Lot Owner from conducting home occupations in 
the Dwelling, which occupation is subordinate to the primary residential use and occupies not 
greater than twenty (20%) percent of the Dwellings floor area or employs no more than 2 
persons. No Lot Owner shall be permitted to grant additional easements to Owners of contiguous 
or adjacent properties. 
 
Section 8.02 Recreation Lots. Lots identified as "Recreation Lots" on the Plat shall be used for 
recreation purposes only, and not for living quarters. No building constructed on a Recreation 
Lot may contain any bathing or toilet facilities. Construction of buildings or other structures on 
the Recreation Lots is subject to ARC approval. Any building constructed below the 87' 
elevation is subject to approval by the Army Corps of Engineers. 
 
Section 8.03 Recreational Vehicles. Self-contained recreational vehicles will be allowed on an 
Owner's Lot for not more than ten (10) consecutive days and no more than ninety (90) days in a 
calendar year. Any improvements made to the property to accommodate recreational vehicles 
must be approved by the ARC. 
 
Section 8.04 Parking and Garages. All vehicles will park only in their garages or in the 
driveways serving their Lots or appropriate spaces or designated areas in which parking may or 
may not be allowed and then subject to such reasonable rules and regulations as the Board may 



adopt. All commercial vehicles (i.e., those having lettering or logos), tractors, mobile homes, 
trailers (either with or without wheels), campers, camper trailers, boats and other watercraft, and 
boat trailers and any unregistered vehicle must be parked entirely within a garage unless 
otherwise permitted by the Board. No garage may be altered in such a manner that the number of 
automobiles, which may reasonably be parked therein after the alteration, is less than the number 
of automobiles that could have reasonably been parked in the garage as originally constructed. 
Any such vehicle or recreational equipment parked in violation of these or other regulations 
contained herein or in the rules and regulations now or hereafter adopted by the Association may 
be towed by the Association at the sole expense of the Owner of such vehicle or recreational 
equipment. No member of the ARC or of the Association shall be guilty of trespass, conversion 
or otherwise, nor guilty of any criminal act by reason of such towing and neither its removal or 
failure of the Owner to receive any notice of said violation shall be grounds for relief of any 
kind. 
 
Section 8.05 Vehicle Maintenance and Repair. No maintenance or repairs shall be performed on 
any vehicles upon any portion of the Property, unless performed in a garage, except in an 
emergency situation. Notwithstanding the foregoing, all repairs to disabled vehicles within the 
Property must be completed within twenty-four (24) hours from its immobilization or the vehicle 
must be removed. 
 
Section 8.06 Signs. No sign or other advertising device of any nature shall be placed upon any 
part of the Property except as provided herein. The ARC may, in its discretion, adopt and 
promulgate rules and regulations relating to signs, which may be employed. Signs and other 
advertising devices may be erected and maintained upon any portion of the Property if approved 
by the ARC as to color, location, nature, size and other characteristics of such signs or devices. 
Regardless of ARC determination, there will be no "For Sale" signs located on property until 
such time as the Developer has sold the last Lot in the Development. This shall include any 
property conveyed to Wilcox County within the perimeter of the Development. Notwithstanding 
the foregoing, Declarant specifically reserves the right to itself, its successors, nominees, assigns, 
to place and maintain signs in connection with identification, sale, or information anywhere on 
the Property. 
 
Section 8.06.01 Removal. Developer or any member of the ARC committee shall have the right 
to remove any sign, advertisement, billboard or structure which is placed on any Lot in violation 
of these Covenants, and in so doing, shall be not be liable, and are hereby expressly released 
from any liability for trespass or other tort in connection therewith, or arising from such removal. 
 
Section 8.06.01 Removal. Developer or any member of the ARC committee shall have the right 
to remove any sign, advertisement, billboard or structure which is placed on any Lot in violation 
of these Covenants, and in so doing, shall be not be liable, and are hereby expressly released 
from any liability for trespass or other tort in connection therewith, or arising from such removal. 
 
Section 8.07 Maintenance of Hedges and Plants. Each Owner shall be responsible for and shall 
maintain all landscaping, grass, driveways, parking areas, structures and grounds located on each 
Lot in good condition and repair and in a neat and attractive manner. The Association shall have 
the right to enter upon any part of a Lot in order to cut, trim, prune or replace, at the expense of 



the Owner, any grassed area, hedge or other planting which in the opinion of the Association or 
the ARC, by reason of its location upon the Lot or the height to which it is permitted to grow, is 
unreasonably detrimental to the adjoining property or obscures the view of street traffic or is 
unattractive in appearance, provided, however, that the Owner shall be given fifteen (15) days' 
prior written notice of such action. 
 
Section 8.07.01 Maintenance by the Association. Prior to the submission and implementation of 
a landscape plan by the Owner, the Association shall be responsible to maintain all open field 
properties, as best managed, utilizing a tractor and bush mower. The Association shall hold any 
individual Lot Owner harmless from any liability for damage or injury to machinery or laborers 
in the execution of said maintenance in so far as the terrain has not been altered by the Owner in 
a manner as to create a hazard. Likewise, the Association shall not be responsible for damage to 
any structures, plantings, or other features not properly identified to and approved by the ARC. 
The Lot Owner shall become responsible for the overall maintenance of the lot upon receipt of 
their certificate of occupancy or portions of their Lot, as modified and approved by ARC, upon 
receipt of a written notice of approval by the ARC. 
 
Section 8.08 Occupants Bound. All provisions of these Covenants and of any rules and 
regulations or use restrictions promulgated pursuant hereto which govern the conduct of Owners 
and which provide for sanctions against Owners shall also apply to all occupants of any Lot. 
 
Section 8.09 Minimum Square Footage. No dwelling shall be erected on any Lot having less than 
1,600 square feet heated floor-space, with a minimum footprint of 1,200 square feet heated floor-
space. However, the ARC reserves the right to approve the construction of a home that does not 
meet the minimum square footage herein designated if, in the opinion of the ARC, the Lot size is 
deemed inadequate for the minimum square footage, or if the construction proves to be a 
hardship for any particular Lot. 
 
Section 8.10 Log Homes. - Log Homes shall be allowed in the community which have been 
approved by the ARC. 
 
Section 8.11 Animals and Pets. Horses and ponies are expressly permitted on Lots with a 
maximum of one (1) per five (5) acres and one (1) every two (2) acres additional or as approved 
by the ARC. No animals may be raised, bred, kept or permitted on an Owner's Lot, with the 
exception of dogs, cats or other usual and common household pets, which may number six (6), 
but not more than a total of two (2) dogs (outdoor dogs); provided, however, those pets are not 
permitted to roam free outside the Lot perimeter, or, in the sole discretion of the Association, 
endanger the health, make objectionable noise or constitute a nuisance or inconvenience to the 
Owners of other Lots or the Owner of any property located adjacent to the Property. 
Noncompliance may result in the removal of said pet(s). No pets shall be kept, bred or 
maintained for any commercial purpose on residential Lots. Dogs which are household pets 
shall, at all times whenever they are outside an Owner's Lot, be confined on a leash held by a 
responsible person. Dogs shall be walked only in those areas designated by the Association. 
 
 



Section 8.12 Nuisance. It shall be the responsibility of each Owner to prevent the development of 
any unclean, unhealthy, unsightly or unkempt condition on his or her Lot. No Lot shall be used, 
in whole or in part, for the storage of any property or item that will cause such Lot to appear to 
be in an unclean or untidy condition or that will be obnoxious to the eye; nor shall any substance, 
thing or material be kept upon any Lot that will emit foul or obnoxious odors or might disturb the 
peace, quiet, safety, comfort or serenity of the occupants of surrounding property. No obnoxious 
or offensive activity shall be carried out, which causes discomfort, annoyance or nuisance to any 
person using any property adjacent to the Lot. There shall not be maintained any plants or 
animals or device or thing of any sort whose activities or existence in any way is noxious, 
dangerous, unsightly, unpleasant or of a nature as may diminish or destroy the enjoyment of the 
Property. 
 
Section 8.13 Unsightly or Unkempt Conditions. The pursuit of hobbies or other activities, 
including specifically, without limiting the generality of the foregoing, the assembly and 
disassembly of motor vehicles and other mechanical devices which might tend to cause 
disorderly, unsightly or unkempt conditions, shall not be pursued or undertaken on any part of 
the Property. 
 
Section 8.14 Antennas. No exterior television or radio antennas or satellite dishes of any kind 
shall be placed, allowed or maintained upon any portion of the Property, including any Lot, 
without the prior written consent of the ARC or its designee. 
 
Section 8.15 Garbage Cans, Tanks, Etc. All garbage cans, above-ground tanks and other similar 
items shall be located or screened so as to be concealed from view of neighboring Lots, streets 
and property located adjacent to the Lot. All rubbish, trash and garbage shall be regularly 
removed from the Lot and shall not be allowed to accumulate thereon. Clothlines are not allowed 
on any Lot. 
 
Section 8.16 Subdivision of Lots. No Lot shall be subdivided. Boundary lines may not be 
changed without the prior written approval of the Board. Any such approved division, boundary 
line change or re-plotting shall not be in violation of the applicable subdivision and zoning 
regulations. (See also Section 5.05) 
 
Section 8.17 Pools. No aboveground pools shall be erected, constructed or installed on any Lot. 
 
Section 8.18 Irrigation. No sprinkler or irrigation systems of any type which draw upon water 
from creeks, streams, rivers, lakes, ponds, canals or other waterways within the Property shall be 
installed, constructed or operated within the Property, unless approved by the ARC and, if 
applicable, Army Corps of Engineers. 
 
Section 8.19 Tents, Trailers and Temporary Structures. Owners or occupants shall not place upon 
a Lot or any part of the Property any tent or trailer or any structure of a temporary nature, such as 
a tent or shack. 
 
 



Section 8.20 Drainage. No Owner shall do or permit any work, construct any improvements, 
place any landscaping or suffer the existence of any condition whatsoever which shall alter or 
interfere with the drainage pattern of the Property, except to the extent such alternation and 
drainage pattern is approved in writing by the ARC or Board and except for rights reserved to 
Declarant to alter or change the drainage patterns. 
 
Section 8.21 Construction Regulations of the Architectural Guidelines. All Owners and 
contractors shall comply with the construction regulations portion of the Architectural 
Guidelines. Such regulations may effect, without limitations, the following: trash and debris 
removal; sanitary facilities; parking areas; outside storage; restoration of damaged property; 
conduct and behavior of builders, subcontractors and Owners' representatives on the Property at 
any time; the conservation of landscape materials; fire protection and adherence to ADEM Best 
Management Practice regarding ground water pollution protection and sediment control. 
 
Section 8.22 House Numbers and Mail Boxes. Each dwelling shall have a house number, 
mailbox and paper box with a design and location established by the ARC. 
 
Section 8.23 Continuity of Construction. All improvements commenced on the Property shall be 
prosecuted diligently to completion and shall be completed within twelve (12) months of 
commencement, unless an exception is granted in writing by the ARC. If an improvement is 
commenced and construction is then abandoned for more than ninety (90) days, or if 
construction is not completed within the required twelve-month period, then fines may be 
imposed per the Architectural Guidelines. Such charges shall be a Default Assessment and lien 
as provided in Section 4.02 above. Landscaping shall be completed within 150 days of 
completion of construction (final landscape plans within ninety (90) days of Certificate of 
Occupancy, landscaping completed within sixty (60) days of final submission) or fines may be 
imposed as defined in the Architectural Guidelines. 
 
Section 8.24 Leasing. The Owner of a Lot shall have the right to lease such residential structure, 
subject to the following conditions: 
 
(a) All leases shall be in writing and for a minimum term of ninety (90) days. 
 
(b) The lease shall be specifically subject to Legacy Shores Documents, and any failure of tenant 
to comply with Legacy Shores Documents shall be a default under the lease. 
 
(c) The Owner shall be liable for any violation of Legacy Shores Documents committed by the 
Owner's tenant, without prejudice to the Owner's right to collect any sums paid by the Owner on 
behalf of the tenant. 
 
Section 8.25 Setback Lines. No building shall be located nearer than twenty (20) feet to any road 
right-of-way; nor located any nearer than ten (10) feet to any interior lot line; nor located nearer 
than ten (10) feet from the back property lines or as required by Alabama Power Company. ARC 
must approve the exact location of all Buildings before the foundation is poured. (See Section 
5.01 - Utility easement). Zero lot line setback may be allowed on driveways by approval of the 
ARC. 



Section 8.26 Water Supply. There is no central water supply system currently available to the 
Legacy Shores Subdivision. Therefore, each Owner shall, at his expense, be responsible for 
drilling and maintaining a well for the water supply to each Lot. Installation of all wells must be 
performed under the guidelines of, and with specific permission from, the Wilcox County Health 
Department. Said well shall be used as the sole source of water for all purposes on each Lot 
(including but not limited to water for all water spigots and outlets located within and without all 
buildings, air conditioning and heating, irrigation purposes (except as allowed under Section 
8.18), swimming pools or other exterior uses). 
 
Section 8.27 Easements, Rights and Responsibility for Charges. In addition to the easements 
described in Section 5.01, Alabama Power Company shall have a 15-foot wide utility easement 
along all Lot lines and will have authority to exceed these limits as necessary within the 
subdivision for the installation of guy wires and anchors. Alabama Power Company may 
sublease this pole line for the installation of aerial cables to other utilities, which serve the 
public. Wilcox County shall have a 10-foot wide drainage easement along all interior Lot lines. 
 
Section 8.28 No Overhead Wires, All telephone, electric and other utility lines and connections 
between the main utility lines and the residence or other building located on each Lot shall be 
concealed and located under ground, unless necessary to maintain existing electrical service by 
Alabama Power Company, or by hardship as may be determined by the ARC. Each Lot Owner 
requiring an original or additional electrical service shall be responsible to complete at his 
expense the secondary electric service, conduits, wires, conductors and other electric facilities 
from the point of the applicable transformer to the Owner's Lot improvements, and all of the 
same shall be underground and remain the property of the Lot Owner of each such Lot. 
 

ARTICLE IX 
WATERFRONT AREAS AND WATERWAYS 

 
9.01 Restrictions on Lakes and Lakefront Areas. Any Lot which shall abut upon a lake, stream, 
pond, wetland or other waterway shall be subject to the following additional restrictions. 
 
(a) No pier, dock, or other structure or obstruction or any wall, revetment, rip-rap or any other 
material shall be built, placed or maintained upon any waterfront Lot or into or upon any 
waterway on the Property or adjacent thereto except with the specific written approval of the 
ARC and Army Corps of Engineers. As to any such structure, approval by the ARC shall be 
required prior to submission for approvals or permits from Army Corps of Engineers (its 
successors or assigns), or any other such private or governmental agency as may be now or 
hereafter required. 
 
(b) Except with the prior written approval of the Association or the ARC, no device or material 
may be constructed, placed or installed upon any Lot which shall in any way alter the course of 
natural boundaries of any water way or which shall involve or result in the removal of water 
from any waterway. 
 
(c) The Owner of each Lot abutting the water's edge shall release and discharge the Association 
from any and all claims for debt or damages sustained by the Owner or existing in the Owner's 



favor, to the Owner, the Owner's property and property rights heretofore or hereafter sustained or 
to accrue by reason or account of the operation and maintenance of said lakes, ponds, wetlands 
or other waterways. 
 
(d) Dock corridors are subject to a ten (10') foot setback from each Lot line, thereby restricting 
the dock corridors on fifty-foot recreation lots to a maximum of thirty (30') feet. 
 

ARTICLE X 
MAINTENANCE 

 
Section 10.01 Association's Responsibility. The Association shall maintain and keep in good 
repair those areas designated as common areas, common area private roads, all signs, road side 
maintenance and entrance area into Legacy Shores, such maintenance to be funded assessments 
as provided previously in Article IV. This maintenance shall include, but not be limited to, 
maintenance, repair and replacement, subject to any insurance then in effect, of all landscaping 
and other flora, structures and improvements situated in roadway and entrance area. The 
Association shall further maintain and keep manicured all common areas, including routine 
maintenance of utilities, etc., and all signs used for informational purposes throughout the 
community. 
 
Section 10.02 Owner's Responsibility. Except as provided otherwise in applicable Legacy Shores 
Documents or by written agreement with the Association, all maintenance of the Lots and all 
structures, landscaping, parking areas and other improvements thereon shall be the sole 
responsibility of the Owner thereof, who shall maintain said Lot in accordance with the 
community-wide standards of Legacy Shores, The Association shall, at the direction of the 
Board, assume the maintenance responsibilities of such Owner if, in the opinion of the Board, the 
level and quality of maintenance being provided by such Owner does not satisfy such standard. 
Before assuming the maintenance responsibilities, the Board shall notify the Owner in writing of 
its intention to do so, and if such Owner has not commenced and diligently pursued remedial 
action within thirty (30) days after mailing of such written notice, then the Association shall 
proceed. The expense of such maintenance by the Association shall be reimbursed to the 
Association by the Owner, together with interest at five (5%) percent per annum above the prime 
rate charged by the Association's bank, or such other rate set by the Board, from the date of 
expenditure. Such charges shall be a Default Assessment and lien on the Lot or the Owner as 
provided in Section 4.02 above. 
 

ARTICLE XI 
DAMAGE OR DESTRUCTION 

 
Section 11.01 Damage or Destruction Affecting Lots. In the event of damage or destruction to 
the improvements located on any Lot, the Owner thereof shall promptly repair and restore the 
damaged improvements to their condition prior to such damage or destruction. If such repair or 
restoration is not commenced within one hundred eighty (180) days from the date of such 
damage or destruction, or if repair and reconstruction is commenced but then abandoned for a 
period of more than ninety (90) days, then the Association may impose fines per the 



Architectural Guidelines. Such fine shall be a Default Assessment and a lien against the Lot as 
provided in Section 4.02 above. 
 

ARTICLE XII 
ENFORCEMENT OF COVENANTS 

 
Section 12.01 Violations Deemed a Nuisance. Every violation of these Covenants or any other of 
Legacy Shores Documents is deemed to be a nuisance and is subject to all the remedies provided 
for the abatement of the violation. In addition, all public and private remedies allowed by law or 
in equity against anyone in violation of these Covenants shall be available'. 
 
Section 12.02 Compliance. Each Owner or other occupant of any part of the Property shall 
comply with the provisions of Legacy Shores Documents as the same may be amended from 
time to time. 
 
Section 12.03 Failure to Comply. Failure to comply with Legacy Shores Documents shall be 
grounds for an action to recover damages or for injunctive relief to cause any such violation to be 
remedied, or both. Reasonable notice and an opportunity for a hearing as provided in the By-
Laws shall be given to the delinquent party prior to commencing any legal proceedings. 
 
Section 12.04 Who May Enforce. Any action to enforce Legacy Shores Documents may be 
brought by the Board in the name of the Association on behalf of the Owners. After a written 
request from an aggrieved Owner, the aggrieved Owner may bring such action before the Board. 
If, after meeting with Board of Directors, no action is taken to enforce Legacy Shores 
Documents then the aggrieved Owner may appeal to the Board. If, after meeting with the Board, 
no action is taken to enforce Legacy Shores Documents, then the aggrieved Owner may bring 
such action. 
 
Section 12.05 Remedies. In addition to the remedies set forth above, any violation of Legacy 
Shores Documents shall give the Board, the Manager or a designated representative of the 
Declarant, on behalf of the Owners, the right to enter upon the offending premises or take 
appropriate peaceful action to abate, remove, modify or replace, at the expense of the offending 
Owner, any structure, thing or condition that may exist thereon contrary to the interest and 
meaning of Legacy Shores Documents. If the offense occurs on any easement, walkway, 
Common Area or the like, the cure shall be at the expense of the Owner or other person 
responsible for the offending condition. 
 
Section 12.06 Non-Exclusive Remedies. All the remedies set forth herein are cumulative and not 
exclusive. 
 
Section 12.07 No Waiver. The failure of the Board of Directors, Declarant, the Manager, the 
ARC or any aggrieved Owner to enforce Legacy Shores Documents shall not be deemed a 
waiver of the right to do so for any subsequent violations or of the right to enforce any other part 
of Legacy Shores Documents at any future time. 



Section 12.08 No Liability. No member of the Board of Directors, Declarant, the Manager, the 
ARC, or any Owner shall be liable to any other Owner for the failure to enforce any other 
Legacy Shores Documents. 
 
Section 12.09 Recovery of Costs. If legal assistance is obtained to enforce any of the provisions 
of Legacy Shores Documents, or in any legal proceeding (whether or not suit is brought) for the 
damages or for the enforcement of Legacy Shores Documents or the restraint of violations of 
Legacy Shores Documents, the prevailing party shall be entitled to recover all costs incurred by 
it in such action, including reasonable attorney's fees as may be incurred, or if suit is brought, as 
may be determined by the court. 
 

ARTICLE XIII 
RESOLUTION OF DISPUTES 

 
If any dispute or question arises between Members or between Members and the Association or 
the ARC relating to the interpretation, performance or non-performance, violation or 
enforcement of Legacy Shores Documents, such dispute or violation may be subject to a hearing 
and determination by the Board in accordance with the procedures set forth in the By-Laws. 
 

ARTICLE XIV 
DURATION OF THESE COVENANTS AND AMENDMENT 

 
Section 14.01 Term. The covenants and restrictions of these Covenants shall run with and bind 
the Property, and shall inure to the benefit of and shall be enforceable by the Association or the 
Owner of any property subject to this Covenants, their respective legal representatives, heirs, 
successors and assigns for a term of twenty (20) years from the date these Covenants are 
recorded, after which time they shall be automatically extended for successive periods of ten (10) 
years, unless an instrument in writing, signed by a majority of the then Owners, has been 
recorded within the year preceding the beginning of each successive period of ten (10) years, 
agreeing to change covenants and restrictions, in whole or in part, or to terminate the same. 
 
Section 14.02 Amendment. Amendments to these Covenants, Articles, and the By-Laws may be 
made only as follows: 
 
(a) Material Amendments. The Board of Directors, whenever a majority shall deem it necessary, 
shall propose Amendments (changes), or, on the written application of twenty percent (20%) of 
the Members, shall call a Special Meeting of the members for proposing Amendments, which, in 
either case shall be valid for all intents and purposes, as part of the documents, when approved 
by absentee ballot of two thirds (66%) of all Members of the Association, or unilaterally by 
Declarant until such time as Legacy Shores Homeowners Association is formed. 
 
(b) Other Amendments. All other (minor or unimportant) amendments may be made by a 
majority vote of all the Board of Directors, or unilaterally by Declarant until such time as Legacy 
Shores Homeowners Association is formed. 
 



(c) Recording Amendments. Any amendment must be recorded in the Probate Office of Wilcox 
County, Alabama. 
 
Section .14.03 Effective on Recording. Any modification or amendment shall be immediately 
effective upon recording in the Probate Office of Wilcox County, Alabama, a copy of such 
amendment of modification, executed and acknowledged by the necessary number of Owners 
(and by Declarant, as required), together with a duly authenticated Certificate of the Secretary of 
the Association stating that the required number of consents of Owners were obtained and are on 
file in the office of the Association. 
 

ARTICLE XV 
PRINCIPLES OF INTERPRETATION 

 
Section 15.01 Severability. These Covenants, to the extent possible, shall be construed or 
reformed so as to give validity to all of its provisions. Any provision of these Covenants found to 
be prohibited by law or unenforceable shall be ineffective to the extent of such prohibition or 
unenforceability without invalidating any other part hereof. 
 
Section 15.02 Construction. In interpreting words in these Covenants, unless the context shall 
otherwise provide or require, the singular shall include the plural, the plural shall include the 
singular, and the use of any gender shall include all genders. In these covenants, the phrase 
"voting in person or by absentee ballot" (or similar wording) requires that a ballot, on this issue 
must be mailed, faxed or emailed to each member to vote on and the vote total is the sum of the 
members voting in person and those voting by absentee ballot. 
 
Section 15.03 Headings. The headings are included for purposes of convenient reference, and 
they shall not affect the meaning or interpretation of these Covenants. 
 
Section 15.04 Registration of Mailing Address. Each Member shall register his mailing address 
with the Secretary of the Association from time to time, and notices or demands intended to be 
served upon or given to a Member shall be personally delivered or sent by mail, postage prepaid, 
addressed in the name of the Member at such registered mailing address. 
 
Section 15.05 Notice. All notices or requests required shall be in writing. Notice to any Member 
shall be considered delivered and effective upon personal delivery or three (3) days after posting, 
when sent by certified mail, return receipt requested, to the address of such Member on file in the 
records of the Association at the time of such mailing. Notice to the Board, the Association, the 
ARC or the Manager shall be considered delivered and effective upon personal delivery or three 
(3) days after posting, when sent by certified mail, return receipt requested, to the Association, 
the Board, the ARC or the Manager at such address as shall be established by the Association 
from time to time by notice to the Members. General notices to all Members or any classification 
thereof need not be certified, but may be sent by regular first class mail. 
 
Section 15.06 Waiver. No failure on the part of the Association, the Board, or the ARC to give 
notice of default or to exercise or to delay in exercising any right or remedy shall operate as a 
waiver, except as specifically provided above in the event the Board fails to respond to certain 



requests. No waiver shall be effective unless it is in writing, signed by the Chairperson or Vice 
Chairperson of the Board on behalf of the Association, or by the Chairperson of the ARC on 
behalf of the ARC. 
 
Section 15.07 Limitation of Liability and Indemnification. The Association shall indemnify 
every Board Member or Committee Member against any and all expenses, including trial and 
appellate attorney's fees and costs reasonably incurred by or imposed upon any officer or director 
in connection with any action, suit or other proceeding (including settlement of any suit or 
proceeding, if approved by the then Board) to which he or she may be party by reason of being 
or having been a Board Member or Committee Member, The Board Members and Committee 
Members shall not be liable for any mistake of judgment, negligent or otherwise, except for their 
own individual willful malfeasance, misconduct or bad faith. The Board Members and 
Committee Members shall have no personal liability with respect to any contract or other 
commitment made by them, in good faith, on behalf of the Association (except to the extent that 
such Board Member and Committee Member may also Members of the Association), and the 
Association shall indemnify and forever hold each such Board Member or Committee Member 
free and harmless against any and all liability to others on account of any such contract or 
commitment. Any right to indemnification provided for herein shall not be exclusive of any other 
rights to which any Board Member or Committee Member may be entitled. 
 
Section 15.08 Conflicts Between Documents. In case of conflict between these Covenants and 
the Articles or the By-Laws, these Covenants shall control. In case of conflict between these 
Covenants and the Architectural Guidelines, these Covenants shall control. 
 
Section 15.09 Litigation. No judicial or administrative proceeding shall be commenced or 
prosecuted by the Association unless approved by a majority vote of the Board. This Section 
15.09 shall not apply, however, to: (a) actions brought by the Association to enforce the 
provisions of these Covenants (including, without limitation, the foreclosure of lien); (b) the 
imposition and collection of Assessments as provided in Article IV hereof; (c) proceedings 
involving challenges to ad valorem taxation; or (d) counterclaims or cross-claims brought by the 
Association in proceedings instituted against it. This Section 15.09 shall not be amended unless 
such amendment is approved by the percentage votes and, pursuant to the same procedures, 
necessary to institute proceedings as provided herein. 
 
Section 15.10 Indemnity for Damages. Each and every Owner and future Owner, in accepting a 
deed or contract for any Lot subject to these restrictions agrees to indemnify Declarant for any 
damage caused by such Owner, or the contractor, agent or employees of such Owner, to roads, 
streets, gutters, walkways or other aspects of public ways, including all surfacing thereon, or to 
water, drainage or storm sewer lines, or sanitary sewer lines, or other utilities such as telephone, 
cable television, electricity or gas lines. 
 
Section 15.11 Assignment. Declarant may assign all or any part of its rights and reservations 
hereunder to any successor who takes title to all or part of the Property in a bulk purchase for the 
purpose of development and sale, Such successor shall be identified, the particular rights being 
assigned shall be specified, and, to the extent required, concomitant obligations shall be 



expressly assumed by such successor, all in written instrument duly recorded in the Probate 
Office of Wilcox County, Alabama. 
 
Section 15.12 Termination of any Responsibility of Declarant. If Declarant conveys fee title to 
all of the remaining portion of the Property then owned by Declarant, to any entity or 
individual(s), then: 
 
(a) Declarant will be relieved of the performance of any further duty or obligation in this 
Declaration; and 
 
(b) Such entity or individual(s) will be obligated to perform all duties and obligations of 
Declarant under the Governing Documents. 

 
ARTICLE XVI INSURANCE 

 
Section 16.01 The Association shall obtain and maintain the following insurance coverages: 
 
(a) Fire insurance-for one hundred percent (100%) of the full replacement value of all Common 
Area Improvements, without deduction for depreciation or coinsurance. To the extent advisable 
(in the Board's sole discretion), such policy shall contain the following endorsements and/or 
provisions: 
 

(i) An extended coverage endorsement; 
 
(ii) Vandalism and malicious mischief coverage; 
 
(iii) A determinable cash adjustment clause or similar clause which permits cash 
settlement covering the full value of the damaged or destroyed Improvements in the event 
of a decision not to rebuild. 

 
Such policy shall name as insured the Association, the Owners, Declarant (so long as Declarant 
is an Owner), and all Mortgagees as their respective interests may appear and may contain a loss 
payable endorsement in favor of the trustee described in Section 16.04. 
 
(b) Comprehensive general liability insurance that covers the Association, the Board, Declarant, 
any Manager, Owners, Occupants and their respective family members, guests, invitees and the 
agents and employees of each against any liability incident to the Ownership or use of the 
Common Area(s). The limits of such insurance shall not be less than $1,000,000 per occurrence. 
If obtainable, such insurance shall contain: 
 

(i) A "severability of interest" endorsement to preclude the insurer from denying an 
Owner's claim due to a negligent act by other Owners of the Association; and 
 
(ii) A cross liability to each insured. 
 
(iii) Workers' compensation insurance in compliance with all applicable laws. 



(c) A fidelity bond or insurance covering any Person who handles funds of the Association 
including, but not limited to, officers, members of the Board of Directors and employees of the 
Association, and employees of the Manager, whether or not such Persons are compensated for 
their services, in an amount not less than the estimated maximum funds, including reserve funds 
in the custody of the Association or the Manager, as the case may be, at any given time during 
the term of each bond. 
 
(d) Officers and directors liability insurance. 
 
(e) Any other insurance which the Association deems appropriate. 
 
Section 16.02 Blanket insurance policy premiums are a Common Expense to be included in the 
regular assessments. 
 
Section 16.03 Unless specified herein, the amount, term, coverage, deductible, named insureds 
and loss payees, shall be determined by the Board and shall satisfy the minimum requirements 
imposed for this type of Project by FNMA and FHLMC. If the FNMA and FHLMC 
requirements conflict, the more stringent requirements shall be met. If FNMA and FHLMC do 
not impose requirements on any policy required hereunder, the term, amount, coverage and other 
provisions of such policy shall be determined by the Board in light of what is customary for 
similar policies on similar projects in the area. 
 
Section 16.04 All fire and casualty insurance proceeds, payable under Section 16.01, subject to 
the rights of Mortgagees, may be paid to a trustee, to be held and expended for the benefit of the 
Owners, Mortgagees, and others, as their respective interests shall appear. The trustee shall be a 
commercial bank or other financial institution with trust powers in the County in which the 
Property is located that agree in writing to accept such trust. If repairs or reconstruction is 
authorized, the Association shall have the duty to contract for such work as provided for in this 
Declaration. 
 
Section 16.05 It shall be the responsibility of the Owners and not the Association to obtain 
insurance coverage at their own expense on the improvements, if any, constructed on each lot, 
and on their personal property and fixtures, and in addition to obtain comprehensive personal 
liability insurance which shall include coverage of liability for damage to person or property of 
others located on the Owner's lot, or on another lot, or upon the Common Elements resulting 
from the negligence of the insured owner. 
 
Section 16.06 Each hazard insurance policy must be written by a carrier who meets FNMA 
requirements for a "Best Rating". 
 
Section 16.07 The Association must immediately give a copy of any insurance policy to the 
Declarant. 
 
 
 



Section 16.08 All insurance policies must require a written thirty (30) day notice of modification 
or termination of coverage from the insurer to the Association, Declarant, Owners and their 
Mortgagees, and any interested party who requests such a notice. 
 
Section 16.09 At least annually, the Board must review the Association's insurance policies to 
determine the amount of the casualty and fire insurance and the fidelity bond. 
 
Section 16.10 If economically feasible, prior to each annual review the Board shall obtain a 
current appraisal of the full replacement value of Common Area Improvements (except for 
foundations and footings) without deduction for depreciation. 
 
Section 16.11 Association insurance policies shall contain the following provisions, if reasonably 
possible, as appropriate: 
 
(a) Statements that the policies are primary and non-contributing. 
 
(b) Statements that an Owner's conduct will not constitute grounds for avoiding liability; 
 
(c) A waiver of the carrier's right of subrogation against any Owner or family member, the 
Association, the Board, the Manager, the Architectural Committee, the Declarant, and any of 
their agents or employees. 
 
DATED: November 20, 2007 
SIGNED BY: Loren Dickey, President, River Bend Landing, LLC 
NOTARIZED BY: Barbara Collins 
State of Alabama, Cullman County 
 



DECLARATION OF COVENANTS, CONDITIONS, RESTRICTIONS AND EASEMENTS 
FOR LEGACY SHORES SUBDIVISION, PHASE II 

 
This Declaration of Covenants, Conditions, Restrictions and Easements for Legacy Shores 
Subdivision is made this It - day of March, 2008, by RIVER BEND LANDING, LLC, a 
Delaware limited liability company (hereinafter referred to as the "Declarant"). 
 
WITNESSETH: 
 
WHEREAS, the Declarant owns certain real property located in the County of Wilcox, State of 
Alabama, being delineated as Legacy Shores Subdivision, Phase II (hereinafter referred to as 
"Phase II"), which is more fully described as follows: 
 
Legacy Shores Subdivision, Phase II, as recorded in Map Book 8, Page 31 in the Office of the 
Judge of Probate, Wilcox County, Alabama, and Declarant intends to develop Phase II as a 
residential and recreational community; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Declarant desires to adopt and restate the Declaration of Covenants, Conditions, 
Restrictions and Easements for Legacy Shores Subdivision Phase I dated November 20, 2007, as 
recorded in Deed Book #11G, Page 37 in the Office of the Judge of Probate of Wilcox County, 
Alabama (hereinafter "Restrictions) in order for Phase II to be subject to the Restrictions; 
 
NOW THEREFORE, the Declarant hereby declares that Phase II and any property hereafter 
made subject hereto as hereinafter provided shall be held, transferred, sold, conveyed, leased, 
occupied and used subject to the Restrictions which are for the purpose of protecting the value 
and desirability of Phase II, and which shall touch and concern and run with title to Phase II. The 
covenants and all provisions hereof shall be binding on all parties having any right, title or 
interest in Phase II or any portion thereof, and their respective heirs, successors, successors in 
title, and assigns, and all others claiming an interest therein or a right thereto and shall inure to 
the benefit of each owner thereof. 
 
ITEM ONE. The following easements are added at the end of Section 3.09.1 of the Restrictions: 
 
(h) There are five (5) easements contained within Phase II of Legacy Shores Subdivision, and 
more fully described on the plat thereof, which are to be maintained by the Lot Owners of the 
Lots which are benefited by the easements, as follows: 
 
(i) Easement #1 across Lots 94, 95 and 96 is for the benefit of Lots 94, 95, and 96 and the cost of 
maintenance of Easement #1 will be shared equally by the Lot Owners of Lots 94, 95 and 96. 
 
(ii) Easement #2 across Lots 93 and 94 is for the benefit of Lot 93 and the cost of maintenance of 
Easement #2 will be paid by the Lot Owner of Lot 93. 
 
(iii) Easement #3 across Lot 89 is for the benefit of Lot 90 and the cost of maintaining Easement 
43 will be paid by the Lot Owner of Lot 90. 
 



(iv) Easement #4 across Lots 102, 103, 104 and 105 is for the benefit of Lots 102, 103, 104 and 
105 and the cost of maintaining Easement #4 will be paid equally by the Lot Owners of Lots 
102, 103, 104 and 105. 
 
(v) Easement #5 across Lot 114 is for the benefit of Lot 114 as well as for the benefit of Lots 
70a, 71a, 72a, 97a, 99a, l00a, 101a, 102a, 103a, 115a, 116a, 117a, 118a, 119a, 120a, 121a, 122a 
and 123a. The cost of maintaining Easement #5 paid equally by the Lot Owners of Lot 114, 70a, 
71a, 72a, 97a, 99a, 100a, 101a, 102a, 103a, 115a, 116a, 117a, 118a, 119a, 120a, 121a, 122a and 
123a equally. 
 
ITEM TWO. All roads leading from County Road 29 and all roads within Legacy Shores 
Subdivision Phase I and Phase II are intended to be private roads for the benefit of Phase I and 
Phase II of Legacy Shores Subdivision. Cost of maintenance of the roads within Legacy Shores 
Subdivision Phase I and Phase II shall be borne by the Legacy Shores Homeowners Association, 
which shall hereafter be comprised of Lot Owners within Phase I and Phase II of Legacy Shores 
Subdivision. 
 
DATED: March 11, 2008 
SIGNED BY: Loren Dickey, President, River Bend Landing, LLC 
NOTARIZED BY: Sherrie Hannah 
State of Alabama, Cullman County 
 


